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Dettagli

Costruttore: Jeanneau

Modello: Cap Camarat 755 WA

Anno: 2005

Condizione: Usato

Motore: , 300 hp

Tipo di motore:  

Tipo di carburante: Gasolio

Lunghezza: 7.52 m (24.67 ft)

Larghezza: 2.57 m (8.43 ft)

Cabine: 0

Ancoraggi: 0
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Descrizione

EN
  Just in at Morgan Marine this lovely 2005 Jeanneau Cap
Camarat 755 Walk Around which had NEW Twin Suzuki DF 175
HP with power trim and tilt fitted in 2021! Complete with must
have options including Raymarine chartplotter, Suzuki engine
controls, Fusion audio, electric windlass, front sundeck
mattress with cushions, full boat cover and Bimini ! This boat
has been much loved by her current owner and have just had
its 20 hour engine service. This boat is perfect for family
adventures or fishing trips. Ready to go now!

Cabin: Transparent sliding plexi door. 2 berth cabin with
storage + shelves, cushions + double berth complement.
Stainless steel sink and with storage on port side. Separate
compartment on starboard side with toilet.

Cockpit: Helm position with engine controls, electronics and
compass. Pilot and co-pilot swivel seats. Cockpit and
windscreen handrails. Aft cockpit bench with cushions and
backrest. Infill cushions. Teak cockpit. Covers for console and
engines - blue. Front removable sundeck mattress cushions.
Fire extinguisher.

Electronics: Raymarine chartplotter. Standard Horizon VHF
radio. Suzuki engine controls. Rokk wireless phone charger
plus USB. Fusion audio with speakers. Electric & manual bilge
pumps.

Machinery: Twin Suzuki DF 175 HP outboards with power trim
and tilt. Fuel capacity 280 litres.

Trailer: SBS R4/3000EL roller trailer with jockey wheel and
winch. NB - the road trailer may not be in serviceable road
worthy condition. It is recommended the buyer should inspect
and service accordingly prior to use on public roads.

Informazione generale

Costruttore: Jeanneau

Modello: Cap Camarat 755 WA

Anno: 2005

Condizione: Usato

Motore

Motore: , 300 hp

Tipo di motore:  

Tipo di carburante: Gasolio

Misure

Lunghezza: 7.52 m (24.67 ft)

Larghezza: 2.57 m (8.43 ft)

Profondo: 0.52 m (1.71 ft)

Peso: 0  ()

Alloggio

Cabine: 0

Ancoraggi: 0

Immagini
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